
🎯 Turn your passion for
games into real skills!

🎨 Discover the secrets of
game design, 3D modelling,
and character animation.

🧠 Learn by doing with
hands-on projects and real-
world tools.

💼 Gain a strong
foundation for future
careers in tech, gaming,
and design.

WHY SHOULD
YOU JOIN THIS

COURSE?

WHAT WILL YOU LEARN?
3D Modelling
Fundamentals
Animation Basics
Game Environment
Design
Creative Thinking &
Teamwork

UNLEASH YOUR
CREATIVITY:

BECOME A GAME
DEVELOPER!

Join our 3D Modelling and
Animation Course for Middle and

High School Students!

www.ecoleschools.org

http://www.ecoleshools.org/


🗓️ Duration: 8 weeks

🕒 Schedule: 2 sessions per
week, 2 hours each

📍 Location: On-site

👨‍🏫 Instructor: Experienced
professionals in game
development

📦 What’s Included: Software
tools, learning materials,
project support

COURSE OVERVUEW &
HOW TO REGISTER

SIGN UP TODAY AND
START YOUR JOURNEY!

WHO CAN JOIN?

✅ Middle and high school
students (Grades 6–12)
 ✅ Beginners and aspiring
game creators
 ✅ Curious minds with a love
for technology, art, or
storytelling
 ✅ Gamers who want to go
beyond playing

Shape your future. Design your
dream world.

Phone :

Email :

Website :
Visit our website or contact us to learn more!

www.ecoleschools.org

Address :

No prior experience
needed — we start from
the basics and grow
together!

Is This Course Right for You?

http://www.ecoleshools.org/

